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The purpose of this agreement is to insure protection of confidential information 
in all communication, both written and verbal, and to protect intellectual 
property during all 
phases of investigation and business activities between signed parties or their 
associates. 
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY PROVISIONS 
 
1. Confidentiality:  X and Y realize that some information received by one party 
from the other pursuant to this Agreement may be Confidential Information. 
Both Parties are responsible for providing confidentiality to all information unless 
otherwise specified. Any Confidential Information shall not be disclosed by the 
receiving party to any third party and shall not be used by the receiving party for 
purpose other than those contemplated by this Agreement for a period of two (2) 
years from the cessation of this Agreement. 
  
2. Additional Confidentiality Provisions: 
  
2.1 Each party will use that level of care to prevent the use or disclosure of the 
other party’s Confidential Information as it exercises in protecting its own 
Confidential Information. 
  
2.2 Upon termination of this Agreement each party shall return to the other or 
destroy all Confidential Information as to which the obligation of confidentiality 
has not expired, together with all copies and other forms of reproduction, except 
that a single archive copy of such Confidential Information my be retained by 
each party to monitor compliance with this Agreement. 
 
2.3 No Use of the name(s), of either party in any form of promotion or in 
connection with the sale of services, products, processes, methods, devices, or 
designs or in license negotiations with third parties is permitted without prior 
approval from the other party. 
 
NON-COMPITION PROVISION 
 
3. Intellectual knowledge use, whether in methods, techniques, or information 
are private and confidential and may in no way be reproduced or used without 
written permission of Kid’z Corner, Its principals, Jon Rhodes, or Gina Rhodes. 
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